
From: Ellen Angel
To: Penny Thompson
Subject: Fw: Caribou PD Permit Fee
Date: Wednesday, March 19, 2025 4:33:17 PM
Attachments: Outlook-mptmsclt.png

Need asap  they don't hold appl

Sent from my U.S.Cellular© Smartphone
Get Outlook for Android

From: Aaron Goodine <agoodine@artifexae.com>
Sent: Wednesday, March 19, 2025 4:30:10 PM
To: Ellen Angel <eangel@artifexae.com>
Subject: Caribou PD Permit Fee
 
Ellen,

The fee for the permit is $8,306.34

  Aaron Goodine  
   Architectural Designer

 

   T. 207.974.3028 

   C. 207.717.6055 

   W. www.artifexae.com 

 
   175 Exchange St 
   Bangor, ME 04401 

[This email comes from outside of your organization. Please be cautious opening or clicking
on any attachments or links.]
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